



PRICE TABULATION

Purchase of Recycle and Garbage Collection and Disposal Services

Item #	Location	Quantity & Size	Frequency of Pickup	Republic Services				Texas Disposal Systems, Inc.				Waste Management of Texas, Inc.				Tiger Sanitation, Inc.					
				Price Per Haul or Pickup	Price Per Haul or Pickup Yearly	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Price Per Haul or Pickup	Price Per Haul or Pickup Yearly	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Price Per Haul or Pickup	Price Per Haul or Pickup Yearly	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Price Per Haul or Pickup	Price Per Haul or Pickup Yearly	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Additional Fee per Ton	
1	San Antonio College	One - 30 yd self-contained compactor with cart tipper	Monthly	\$262.00	\$3,144.00	\$510.00	\$6,120.00	\$561.00	\$6,732.00	\$611.00	\$7,332.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00	
3	Northwest Vista College	One - 30 yd self-contained compactor with cart tipper	Monthly	\$262.00	\$3,144.00	\$510.00	\$6,120.00	\$604.00	\$7,248.00	\$611.00	\$7,332.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00	
4	Palo Alto College	One - 30 yd self-contained compactor with cart tipper	Monthly	\$262.00	\$3,144.00	\$510.00	\$6,120.00	\$602.00	\$7,224.00	\$611.00	\$7,332.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00	
5	St. Philip's College - 101 Martin Luther King Dr.	One - 30 yd self-contained compactor with cart tipper	Monthly	\$262.00	\$3,144.00	\$510.00	\$6,120.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$585.00	\$7,020.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00	
6	St. Philip's College	Thirty - 96 Gallon totes	5 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$634.95	\$7,619.40	\$577.00	\$6,924.00	\$611.00	\$7,332.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$505.00	\$6,060.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
7	St. Philip's College - Southwest Campus	Sixteen - 96 Gallon totes	5 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$338.64	\$4,063.68	No Bid	No Bid	\$359.00	\$4,308.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$295.00	\$17,700.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
8	Workforce Center of Excellence	Four - 96 Gallon totes	4 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$84.66	\$1,015.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$108.00	\$1,296.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$115.00	\$5,520.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
9	Westside Education and Training center	One - 3 yd container	4 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$52.00	\$624.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$115.00	\$1,380.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$93.01	\$4,464.48	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
12	Killen Community Education Service Center	One - 6 yd container	4 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$122.40	\$1,468.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.00	\$1,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$101.22	\$4,858.56	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
13	District Office- Houston St.	Ten - 96 Gallon totes	5 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$211.65	\$2,539.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$165.00	\$1,980.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$205.00	\$12,300.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
14	First Responders Academy	One - 4 yd container	5 per month	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$554.00	\$6,648.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$93.01	\$5,580.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
Haul and Rental Fee:					\$12,576.00		\$42,925.44		Incomplete		Incomplete		No Bid		No Bid		\$76,883.64		\$20,640.00	\$160.00	
Total Recycle Fee:					\$55,501.44				Incomplete				No Bid				\$97,683.64				
Price Rank					1				Not Ranked				No Bid				2				
Technical Rank					2				Not Ranked				No Bid				1				
Overall Rank					1				Not Ranked				No Bid				2				

Item #	Location	Quantity & Size	Frequency of Pickup	Republic Services				Texas Disposal Systems, Inc.				Waste Management of Texas, Inc.				Tiger Sanitation, Inc.				
				Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Additional Fee per Ton
1	District Office - Houston St	One - 8 cubic yard container	3 pulls per week. 12 pulls per month	\$263.16	\$3,157.92	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$334.00	\$4,008.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$304.76	\$3,657.12	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
2	Killen Community Education Service Center	One - 8 cubic yard container	3 pulls per week. 12 pulls per month	\$263.16	\$3,157.92	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$336.00	\$4,032.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$304.76	\$3,657.12	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
3	Northwest Vista College - Various locations on campus	Nine - 8 cubic yard containers	2 pulls per week. 72 pulls per month	\$1,578.96	\$18,947.52	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,747.00	\$20,964.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,334.41	\$16,012.92	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
4	Palo Alto College - Sabine Hall	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109.00	\$1,308.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
5	Palo Alto College - Student Center	One - 33 cubic yard compactor	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$573.24	\$6,878.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$547.00	\$6,564.00	\$360.00	\$4,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00
6	Palo Alto College - Ozuna Building	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls pr month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$206.00	\$2,472.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
7	Palo Alto College - Natatorium	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$206.00	\$2,472.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
8	Palo Alto College - Brazos Hall	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109.00	\$1,308.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
9	Palo Alto College - Veterinary Technology Building	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109.00	\$1,308.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
10	Palo Alto College - Performing Arts Building	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109.00	\$1,308.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
11	Palo Alto College - Concho Hall	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$109.00	\$1,308.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
12	Palo Alto College - Facility Building	One - 40 cubic yd roll-off	Pull upon request	\$433.50	\$5,202.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$622.00	\$7,464.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$275.00	\$3,300.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$40.00
13	First Responders Academy	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$164.00	\$1,968.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
14	St. Philip's College - Fine Arts Building	Two - 4 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 16 pulls per month	\$216.24	\$2,594.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$260.00	\$3,120.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$276.95	\$3,323.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
15	St. Philip's College - Campus Center (Loading Dock)	One - 4 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$68.34	\$820.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$71.00	\$852.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$93.01	\$1,116.12	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
16	St. Philip's College - Lot #15	Two - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$350.88	\$4,210.56	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$388.00	\$4,656.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$348.68	\$4,184.16	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
17	St. Philip's College - Central Utility Plant	One - 42 yd compactor	Pull upon request	\$573.24	\$6,878.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$491.00	\$5,892.00	\$387.00	\$4,644.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$40.00
18	San Antonio College - Maintenance Shop	One - 8 cubic yard container	5 pulls per week. 20 pulls per month	\$413.10	\$4,957.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$451.00	\$5,412.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$489.59	\$5,875.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
19	San Antonio College - Cafeteria / Loftin Student Center	Two - 8 cubic yard container	5 pulls per week. 40 pulls per month	\$826.20	\$9,914.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$780.00	\$9,360.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$829.61	\$9,955.32	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

Item #	Location	Quantity & Size	Frequency of Pickup	Republic Services				Texas Disposal Systems, Inc.				Waste Management of Texas, Inc.				Tiger Sanitation, Inc.				
				Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Monthly Price	Yearly Price	Rental Fee per Month	Rental Fee Yearly	Additional Fee per Ton
20	San Antonio College - McAllister Fine Arts Building	One - 8 cubic yard container	5 pulls per week. 20 pulls per month	\$413.10	\$4,957.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$413.00	\$4,956.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$489.59	\$5,875.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
21	San Antonio College - Kohler House	One - 4 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$108.12	\$1,297.44	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$171.00	\$2,052.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$171.99	\$2,063.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
22	San Antonio College - Compactor	One - 35 cubic yard compactor	Pull upon request	\$573.24	\$6,878.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$503.00	\$6,036.00	\$360.00	\$4,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$425.00	\$5,100.00	\$430.00	\$5,160.00	\$0.00
23	San Antonio College - Grounds	One - 30 cubic yard open top container	Pull upon request	\$433.50	\$5,202.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$464.00	\$5,568.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$250.00	\$3,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$40.00
24	St. Philip's College - Southwest Campus - Building 1, Lot 8	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$193.00	\$2,316.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
25	St. Philip's College - Southwest Campus, Building 1, Lot 3	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$193.00	\$2,316.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
26	St. Philip's College - Southwest Campus, Building 1, Lot 70	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$193.00	\$2,316.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
28	Workforce Center of Excellence	One - 8 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$175.44	\$2,105.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$233.00	\$2,796.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$207.85	\$2,494.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
29	Westside Education Training Center	One - 4 cubic yard container	2 pulls per week. 8 pulls per month	\$108.12	\$1,297.44	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$192.00	\$2,304.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$171.99	\$2,063.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
30	Eastside Education Training Center	One - 8 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$92.82	\$1,113.84	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$136.00	\$1,632.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.94	\$1,331.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
31	St. Philip's College - Veterans Outreach and Transition Center (VOTC)	One - 4 cubic yard container	1 pull per week. 4 pulls per month	\$68.34	\$820.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$101.00	\$1,212.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$93.01	\$1,116.12	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
32	District Wide	One - 30 cubic yard roll-off container	5 pulls per year	\$433.50	\$2,167.50	\$51.00	\$51.00	\$564.00	\$2,820.00	\$564.00	\$564.00	\$400.00	\$2,000.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$40.00
33	District Wide	One - 40 cubic yard roll-off container	10 pulls per year	\$433.50	\$4,335.00	\$51.00	\$51.00	\$610.00	\$6,100.00	\$610.00	\$610.00	\$450.00	\$4,500.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$40.00
Total Haul and Rental Fee:				\$107,601.84				\$132,564.00				Incomplete				\$121,714.36				
Total Misc. Roll- Off Container Rental:				\$6,604.50				\$10,094.00				Incomplete				\$4,180.00				
Total Garbage Collecton and Roll-Off Containers:				\$114,206.34				\$142,658.00				Incomplete				\$125,894.36				
Price Rank				1				3				Not Ranked				1				
Technical Rank				2				3				Not Ranked				1				
Overall Rank				1				2				Not Ranked				3				

- Note 1 - The proposals submitted by Texas Disposal Systems, Inc. and Tiger Sanitation, Inc. for the Recycling Collection and Disposal item added additional fees for the installation of new compactors. The \$1,200 charge from Tiger Sanitation, Inc. would only be charged if the compactors were removed in less than
- Note 2 - The proposal submitted by Republic Services included pricing for compactor washout/disinfection which was not requested, not evaluated, or ranked.
- Note 3 - The proposal submitted by Texas Disposal Systems, Inc. is incomplete for Recycle Collection and Disposal Services and was not ranked.
- Note 4 - The services for Northeast Lakeview College will remain with the incumbent Contractor at the same prices and terms.
- Note 5 - Items 12 and 17 were calculated using a quantity of 12 to determine the estimated amount.
- Note 6 - The amounts shown for items 32 and 33 are proposed on a per pick-up and drop-off of container basis , not on a yearly basis, and are included in the total.
- Note 7 - The proposal submitted by Waste Management of Texas, Inc. is incomplete for Garbage Collection and Disposal Services and was not ranked.